

South Western School District
 Bid Opening: Technology Equipment Bid
 South Western School District Administration Office
 Monday, March 1, 2021
 Time: 2:02 PM

Present: South Western School District
 Doug Greenholt
 Sherry Meckley
 Bernie Noel

Bids were received and opened for TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT BID:

VENDOR:	ITEM DESCRIPTION:																								
	Non-Collusion Affidavit	Laptop	Cost (each)	Qty. (65)	Total Bid Price	Desktop	Cost (each)	Qty. (26)	Total Bid Price	Monitors w/Speakers	Cost (each)	Qty. (25)	Total Bid Price	Monitors No Speakers	Cost (each)	Qty. (25)	Total Bid Price	Docking Station	Cost (each)	Qty. (25)	Total Bid Price	Laptop Case	Cost (each)	Qty. (800)	Total Bid Price
GDC	Yes	Dell 5320	\$ 1,034.41	65	\$ 67,236.65	Dell OptiPlex 3080 Micro	\$ 569.49	26	\$ 14,806.74	Dell	\$ 115.13	25	\$ 2,878.25	Dell	\$ 85.54	25	\$ 2,138.50	Dell WD19S	\$ 184.60	25	\$ 4,615.00	Max Cases Slim Sleeve w/Pocket	\$ 17.00	800	\$ 13,600.00
HPI International	Yes	HP Elitebook x360 830 G8	\$ 1,250.00	65	\$ 81,250.00	HP ProDesk 400 G7	\$ 799.00	26	\$ 20,774.00	HP P24h-G4	\$ 151.00	25	\$ 3,775.00	HP P24H-G4	\$ 151.00	25	\$ 3,775.00	HP OSB-C Dock G5	\$ 129.00	25	\$ 3,225.00		\$ 29.95	800	\$ 23,960.00
Integra One	Yes	HPE x360 830	\$ 1,246.48	65	\$ 81,021.20	HPE ProDesk 400	\$ 590.77	26	\$ 15,360.02	HP P24h G4	\$ 144.23	25	\$ 3,605.75	HP P24 G4	\$ 110.55	25	\$ 2,763.75	Option A	\$ 231.59	25	\$ 5,789.75	NO BID			
																		Option B	\$ 163.17	25	\$ 4,079.25				
Link Computer Corporation - Bid 1	Yes	Alternate: Tecra A30-G	\$ 950.00	65	\$ 61,750.00	HP ProDesk 400 G6	\$ 648.00	26	\$ 16,848.00	HP P27h G4 27" Full HD LCD	\$ 164.00	25	\$ 4,100.00	HP E223 21.5" Full HD LED LCD	\$ 149.00	25	\$ 3,725.00	Dynabook Thunderbolt 3 Dock	\$ 198.00	25	\$ 4,950.00	As Spec'd	\$ 30.00	800	\$ 24,000.00
Link Computer Corporation - Bid 2	Yes	HP EliteBook x360 830 G7	\$ 1,395.00	65	\$ 90,675.00	HP ProDesk 400 G6	\$ 648.00	26	\$ 16,848.00	HP P27h G4 27" Full HD	\$ 164.00	25	\$ 4,100.00	HP E223 21.5" Full HD LED	\$ 149.00	25	\$ 3,725.00	HP USB-C Dock G5	\$ 180.00	25	\$ 4,500.00	As Spec'd	\$ 30.00	800	\$ 24,000.00
Mohawk	Yes	NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				NO BID				As Spec'd	\$ 21.89	800	\$ 17,512.00
Virtucom	Yes	HP Elitebook x360 830 G8	\$ 1,179.00	65	\$ 76,635.00	HP ProDesk 400 G7	\$ 613.00	26	\$ 15,938.00	HP 24h G4	\$ 147.00	25	\$ 3,675.00	HP P24 G4	\$ 131.98	25	\$ 3,299.50	HP USB-C Dock G5	\$ 229.00	25	\$ 5,725.00	Targus TED007GL	\$ 18.60	800	\$ 14,880.00